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Message from the Guest Editor

Dear Colleagues,

Two years have passed since our first Special Issue on
“Targets, Tracers and Translation”. In the meantime, the
journal was indexed by SCIE with an impressive IF of 4.286
for 2019. As the first Special Issue was a remarkable
success, it has now been decided that the right time has
arrived to open a Part 2.

With this Special Issue, we want to illustrate and highlight
the variety in recent radiopharmaceutical developments
and the new horizons that are opened toward a broad
spectrum of applications. The final goal of these
developments, of course, the successful translation into
the clinics and into nuclear medicine practice, should
always be the focus.

We cordially invite you to participate in this Special Issue,
“Targets, Tracers and Translation, Part 2—New Horizons in
Radiopharmaceutical Development” and are excited to
receive your latest successful results and share them with
the community. In addition to original works, reviews are
very welcome, as well.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

Because of your expertise in the field of drug sciences, I
kindly invite you to consider publishing your current work,
in the form of a research article or a review, in the open
access electronic journal Pharmaceuticals.

Pharmaceuticals is characterized by an active editorial
board and a dynamic editorial staff. Manuscripts are peer-
reviewed and a final decision is provided to authors within
4–6 weeks aMer submission. Papers are published on the
web immediately aMer acceptance. For details on the
submission process or any other matter, please do not
hesitate to contact us.

We hope to handle your contribution to Pharmaceuticals
soon.
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