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Intermittent fasting (IF) has gained significant attention
as a dietary strategy with potential to improve
cardiovascular health by targeting key modifiable risk
factors. Unlike traditional calorie restriction, IF
encompasses various eating patterns—such as time-
restricted feeding, alternate-day fasting, and the 5:2
regimen—that alternate periods of eating and fasting to
promote metabolic adaptation.   This Special Issue aims
to bring together cutting-edge research and
comprehensive reviews exploring the role of IF in
cardiovascular disease prevention and management.
We particularly welcome studies investigating its effects
on hypertension, dyslipidemia, obesity, type 2 diabetes,
coronary artery disease, heart failure, and other
cardiometabolic conditions. Contributions examining
underlying molecular mechanisms—such as autophagy,
oxidative stress reduction, and endothelial function
improvement—as well as behavioral and adherence-
related aspects are encouraged.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editorial Board
Nutrients is an on-line open access journal that was first
published in 2009. Nutrients adheres to rigorous peer-
review and editorial processes and publishes only high
quality manuscripts that address important issues
related to the impacts of nutrients on human health. The
Impact Factor of Nutrients has risen rapidly since its
establishment and it is now ranked in the first quartile of
journals publishing in the field of nutrition and dietetics
research.
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