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Immunometabolism involves communication between
the immune system, metabolism, and nutrition, and it
has a strong influence on communication between
various physiological systems. This Special Issue will
discuss the importance of immunometabolism in
promoting health and various diseases. Our focus will be
on discussing possible cellular and physiological
mechanisms in different contexts, such as physical
exercise, acute and chronic diseases, nutrition, aging,
inflammation, and other situations, that reflect the
relevance of immunometabolism and can shed light on
the future of the immune system, factoring in the
availability of nutrients and the regulation of the human
metabolism. For this Special Issue, original and review
studies offering perspectives on the importance of
immunometabolism are welcome. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editorial Board
Nutrients is an on-line open access journal that was first
published in 2009. Nutrients adheres to rigorous peer-
review and editorial processes and publishes only high
quality manuscripts that address important issues
related to the impacts of nutrients on human health. The
Impact Factor of Nutrients has risen rapidly since its
establishment and it is now ranked in the first quartile of
journals publishing in the field of nutrition and dietetics
research.
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