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The rise in antimicrobial resistance (AMR) poses a
significant threat worldwide, diminishing the efficacy of
common antimicrobial drugs against widespread
infections. The World Health Organization declared that
AMR is one of the top 10 global public health threats
facing humanity, and it has been predicted that it will
lead to over ten million deaths by 2050. This "silent
pandemic" is a complex "One Health" problem that
requires specific actions and a coordinated approach
across human health, animal and environmental
sectors, and food production. The most valuable tool to
mitigate this crisis is knowledge based on good quality
research.  The aim of this Special Issue is to provide a
collection of articles focused on the research of
antimicrobial resistance in order to improve knowledge
for designing new tools and solutions for effective
prevention, detection, and treatment of drug-resistant
infections in humans. As the of this Special Issue, we are
pleased to invite you to submit original research articles,
review articles, and short communications. Research
areas may include (but are not limited to) antimicrobial
resistance and new therapeutic approaches.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
"Microorganism" merges the idea of the very small with
the idea of the evolving reproducing organism is a
unifying principle for the discipline of microbiology. Our
journal recognizes the broadly diverse yet connected
nature of microorganisms and provides an advanced
publishing forum for original articles from scientists
involved in high-quality basic and applied research on
any prokaryotic or eukaryotic microorganism, and for
research on the ecology, genomics and evolution of
microbial communities as well as that exploring cultured
microorganisms in the laboratory.
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High Visibility:
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PMC, PubAg, CAPlus / SciFinder, AGRIS, and other
databases.

Journal Rank:
JCR - Q2 (Microbiology) / CiteScore - Q1 (Microbiology
(medical))

Rapid Publication:
manuscripts are peer-reviewed and a first decision is
provided to authors approximately 15.2 days after
submission; acceptance to publication is undertaken in 2.9
days (median values for papers published in this journal in
the first half of 2025).
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