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Highly flexible and wearable microfluidic devices have
great potential for applications in medical screening and
diagnostics. The development of wearable microfluidics
for the detection of biomarkers in fluids, such as
perspiration, interstitial fluid, blood, tears, or saliva, has
lagged behind, despite the enormous potential of such
systems. Wearable microfluidic devices face unique
challenges due to the need to interface to the body
and/or collect fluid samples for analysis, driving some
researchers to investigate technologies such as
mechanically flexible and textile-based approaches.
This Special Issue will focus on the development of
flexible and wearable microfluidic-based devices and
systems for a broad range of applications that may
include personalized medicine, athletics, worker safety,
and environmental monitoring and comfort.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
You are invited to contribute research articles or
comprehensive reviews for consideration and
publication in Micromachines (ISSN 2072-666X).
Micromachines is published in the open access format.
Research articles, reviews and other contents are
released on the internet immediately after acceptance.
The scientific community and the general public have
unlimited free access to the content as soon as it is
published. As an open access journal, Micromachines is
supported by the authors or their institutes by payment
of article processing charges (APC) for accepted
papers. We are pleased to welcome you as our authors.
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Rapid Publication:
manuscripts are peer-reviewed and a first decision is
provided to authors approximately 17.2 days after
submission; acceptance to publication is undertaken in 1.9
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