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Globally, colon cancer remains one of the commonly
diagnosed cancers and largest causes of cancer death.
Understanding the complex interactions by which colon
metabolism influences the development of colon cancer
has been a research challenge, but recent years have
seen advances in this field. This section of the journal
will focus on studies that investigate interactions
between metabolites and colon cancer tumor biology,
and global clinical relevance. Topics of interest include:
- Influence of bile acids resulting in promoting

carcinogenesis;
- Dietary risk which is mediated by colorectal

microbiome;
- Impact of meat consumption and fiber-rich foods on

colorectal cancer risk;
- Impact of obesity on development of colorectal

cancer.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
The metabolome is the result of the combined effects of
genetic and environmental influences on metabolic
processes. Metabolomic studies can provide a global
view of metabolism and thereby improve our
understanding of the underlying biology. Advances in
metabolomic technologies have shown utility for
elucidating mechanisms which underlie fundamental
biological processes including disease pathology.
Metabolites is proud to be part of the development of
metabolomics and we look forward to working with many
of you to publish high quality metabolomic studies.
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