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Autoimmune and autoinflammatory diseases are very
heterogenous in terms of frequency, clinical
manifestations and pathogenic mechanisms. 
Autoimmune and autoinflammatory diseases are
currently believed to be the result of interactions
between causative factors (e.g., environmental factors),
genetic predisposition, autoantigens, disturbances in
self-antigen tolerance and the mechanisms of
apoptosis.
Taken to the immense heterogeneity of etiopathogenic
mechanisms, diversity in terms of  susceptibility to the
disease, clinical phenotype and disease progression as
well as the response to applied drugs, there is an
extreme need to individualize health care and
therapeutic approach along with further studies to
elucidate mechanisms underlying autoimmune and
autoinflammatory diseases.
The aim of this Special Issue is to draw attention to
current trends and milestones in the diagnosis,
treatment, clinical course and progression assessment,
as well as experimental studies on the
etiopathogenesis, of these diseases.
We invite colleagues from all over the world to submit
original and review papers as well as case reports.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
You are invited to contribute a research article or a
comprehensive review for consideration and publication
in Medicina (ISSN: 1648-9144). Medicina is an open
access, peer-reviewed scientific journal that publishes
original articles, critical reviews, research notes, and
short communications on medicine. The scientific
community and the general public can access the
content free of charge as soon as it is published.
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