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Laser treatments have been implemented over the past
10 years, and today, new technologies are available for
different skin diseases. Ablative and non-ablative lasers
act on different levels of the epidermis and dermis,
allowing to treat many dermatological conditions. While
at first, laser treatments were used only for skin
rejuvenation, today, they are also used for the treatment
of difficult scenarios such as keloids, scars, and severe
forms of rhinophyma. Differently, aesthetic devices have
been updated with new technologies, leading to
incredible results after few sessions. The spread of new
techniques and protocols needs scientific validation,
and for this reason, the aim of this Special Issue is to
share with the readers new combinations of lasers and
new research in this area.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
You are invited to contribute a research article or a
comprehensive review for consideration and publication
in Medicina (ISSN: 1648-9144). Medicina is an open
access, peer-reviewed scientific journal that publishes
original articles, critical reviews, research notes, and
short communications on medicine. The scientific
community and the general public can access the
content free of charge as soon as it is published.
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