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Cardiac Magnetic Resonance (CMR) plays a unique and
evolving role in clinical practice. It can reliably provide
useful data for diagnosing and evaluating congenital
heart disease, myocardial perfusion,
myocardial/pericardial tissue characterization, and
valvular heart disease with conventional and novel
sequences. We are delighted to introduce a new Special
Issue focusing solely on Cardiovascular Magnetic
Resonance. In this issue, we will consider articles across
a wide spectrum of related areas, ranging from technical
studies, study protocols, review articles, meta-analyses,
research articles (including observation and
randomized), and case reports. These could be in any
area of CMR, including basic science, physics, and
clinical work.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
You are invited to contribute a research article or a
comprehensive review for consideration and publication
in Medicina (ISSN: 1648-9144). Medicina is an open
access, peer-reviewed scientific journal that publishes
original articles, critical reviews, research notes, and
short communications on medicine. The scientific
community and the general public can access the
content free of charge as soon as it is published.
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