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The breathtaking developments in molecular
diagnostics over the past decades and their translation
to clinical practice have enabled insight into the
pathophysiology of diseases that could only be
recognized at the supracellular level until now. The
introduction of molecular techniques for the detection of
genetic and chromosomal disorders has opened up a
range of possibilities for precise diagnostics. This
progress also enables the development of completely
new therapies with influence at the subcellular level,
such as targeted therapy, immunotherapy, cell therapy
and gene therapy. 

The main aim of this Special Issue of Medicina will be to
deliver new insight from the fields of molecular and
cellular medicine that describe the impact of medical
genetics- and genomics-disruptive innovations on the
healthcare system in order to provide better diagnosis
and treatment.

I invite colleagues around the world to report their
experience and knowledge in medical genetics and
genomics with basic, translational and clinical research,
original studies, comparative studies, reviews,
systematic reviews and meta-analyses.
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You are invited to contribute a research article or a
comprehensive review for consideration and publication
in Medicina (ISSN: 1648-9144). Medicina is an open
access, peer-reviewed scientific journal that publishes
original articles, critical reviews, research notes, and
short communications on medicine. The scientific
community and the general public can access the
content free of charge as soon as it is published.
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