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The emergence of multiprincipal element alloys
(MPEAs), known as high-entropy alloys (HEAs) and
medium-entropy alloys (MEAs), has significantly
increased the possibility of discovering new alloys via
traditionally uncommon element grouping. Since this
design concept of MPEAs is promising a broad range of
compositional flexibility, various MPEAs exhibiting
multifunctional performances have been developed
over the past two decades. Moreover, beyond the
advantages of compositional complexity of this type of
alloys, most material scientists have attempted to
finetune the microstructure to overcome the limitation of
the property window of MPEAs via grain refinement,
precipitation hardening, or heterostructuring. Based on
the compositional flexibility of MPEAs, controllable
microstructural factors are diverse, and these
microstructural factors complicatedly affect the
properties of MPEAs. In order to develop a novel
strategy for effectively tailoring the multifunctional
performance of metallic materials, a comprehensive
understanding of the relationship between
microstructure and properties is needed.
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Materials (ISSN 1996-1944) was launched in 2008. The
journal covers twenty-five comprehensive topics:
biomaterials, energy materials, advanced composites,
advanced materials characterization, porous materials,
manufacturing processes and systems, advanced
nanomaterials and nanotechnology, smart materials,
thin films and interfaces, catalytic materials, carbon
materials, materials chemistry, materials physics, optics
and photonics, corrosion, construction and building
materials, materials simulation and design, electronic
materials, advanced and functional ceramics and
glasses, metals and alloys, soft matter, polymeric
materials, quantum materials, mechanics of materials,
green materials, general. Materials provides a unique
opportunity to contribute high quality articles and to take
advantage of its large readership.
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