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Corrosion of alloys is a significant issue that leads to
substantial economic losses and performance
degradation in various industries. Smart coatings have
emerged as a promising solution in the field of surface
engineering for the corrosion protection of alloys. These
coatings possess unique properties that enable them to
respond intelligently to environmental changes, thereby
providing enhanced and long-term protection for alloys
used in critical applications such as in the automotive,
aerospace, and marine industries. The corrosion
process of alloys is complex and influenced by multiple
factors including temperature, humidity, chemical
species in the environment, and mechanical stress.
Smart coatings address these challenges by
incorporating advanced materials and functional
components. Their design and development require an
in-depth understanding and integration of knowledge
from multiple disciplines including materials science,
chemistry, physics, and electrical engineering, spanning
from the micro- to the macro-scale.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Materials (ISSN 1996-1944) was launched in 2008. The
journal covers twenty-five comprehensive topics:
biomaterials, energy materials, advanced composites,
advanced materials characterization, porous materials,
manufacturing processes and systems, advanced
nanomaterials and nanotechnology, smart materials,
thin films and interfaces, catalytic materials, carbon
materials, materials chemistry, materials physics, optics
and photonics, corrosion, construction and building
materials, materials simulation and design, electronic
materials, advanced and functional ceramics and
glasses, metals and alloys, soft matter, polymeric
materials, quantum materials, mechanics of materials,
green materials, general. Materials provides a unique
opportunity to contribute high quality articles and to take
advantage of its large readership.
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