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Friction is one of the main sources of energy dissipation
between the contact surfaces and the dissipation of
energy is the main cause of wear. Although the tribology
in the broadest sense has studied for so long all the
facets of this complex subject have not yet been
thoroughly examined and research in this field is going
on all over the world. Materials is providing a Special
Issue that is intended to be a means for researchers and
engineers of different disciplines to publish and
exchange the latest results of their research. This
Special Issue will focus on progress in understanding
both the fundamental and applied aspects of wear and
friction of materials. With the aim of highlighting this
concept, this special issue will focus on the following
topics: Wear: Theory, Modeling and Simulation. Wear:
Testing and Monitoring. Friction and Wear under
Vibratory Contact. Engine Tribology and wear at high
temperature. Wear of Coatings. Wear of Tools.
Tribocorrosion. Role of Third Bodies during Wear. We
warmly invite you to submit a manuscript(s) for this
Special Issue. Full papers, communications, and reviews
are all welcome.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Materials (ISSN 1996-1944) was launched in 2008. The
journal covers twenty-five comprehensive topics:
biomaterials, energy materials, advanced composites,
advanced materials characterization, porous materials,
manufacturing processes and systems, advanced
nanomaterials and nanotechnology, smart materials,
thin films and interfaces, catalytic materials, carbon
materials, materials chemistry, materials physics, optics
and photonics, corrosion, construction and building
materials, materials simulation and design, electronic
materials, advanced and functional ceramics and
glasses, metals and alloys, soft matter, polymeric
materials, quantum materials, mechanics of materials,
green materials, general. Materials provides a unique
opportunity to contribute high quality articles and to take
advantage of its large readership.
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