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Sponges, the oldest animals on Earth, have been found
to be a trove for biotechnological prospecting. From the
early discoveries of novel marine drugs with
pharmaceutical applications, sponges’ immense
arsenal of secondary metabolites have been proven to
have many potential applications, including as
cosmeceuticals, industrial enzymes, agrochemicals, and
nutraceuticals. Sponge-derived skeletons and
compounds have been used for regenerative medicine
and suggested as drug carriers. Biomimetic and
bioinspired processes have been shown to have many
beneficial uses. The utilization of sponges for
bioremediation, or as bioindicators, has been
demonstrated. Methods of acquiring novel sponge-
derived compounds and obtaining large amounts of
sought-after molecules demand the employment of
many techniques. These include aquaculture, microbial
culture, cell culture, gene mining, natural product
chemistry, and other biotechnological approaches,
taking advantage of the rapid improvements in various
omics methods and new instrumentation.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
During the past few decades there has been an ever
increasing number of novel compounds discovered in
the marine environment. This is exemplified by the
robust preclinical and clinical pipeline that currently
exists for marine natural products. Marine Drugs is
inviting contributions on new advances in marine
biotechnology, pharmacology, chemical ecology,
synthetic biology, and genomics approaches related to
the discovery of therapeutically relevant marine natural
products. Our goal is to share your contribution in a
timely fashion and in a manner that will be valued by the
scientific community.
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