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This Special Issue “Marine-Derived Ingredients for
Cosmeceuticals ” will collect papers on up-to-date
information regarding the historical and potential use of
marine resources, their secondary metabolites, and
molecular constituents for formulating cosmetics and
personal care products. A plethora of physicochemicals
and biological activities, including antimicrobial,
emulsifiers, stabilizers, thickeners and gelling agents,
radical scavenging and antioxidant activity, and UV
filters, make marine organisms interesting sources of
ingredients for the cosmetics industry. This Special
Issue will cover all the most recent advances in the field
of marine resources research and how these
approaches are contributing to defining innovative
trends in marine cosmetic products formulation. Prof.
Dr. Laurence J M Coiffard
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
During the past few decades there has been an ever
increasing number of novel compounds discovered in
the marine environment. This is exemplified by the
robust preclinical and clinical pipeline that currently
exists for marine natural products. Marine Drugs is
inviting contributions on new advances in marine
biotechnology, pharmacology, chemical ecology,
synthetic biology, and genomics approaches related to
the discovery of therapeutically relevant marine natural
products. Our goal is to share your contribution in a
timely fashion and in a manner that will be valued by the
scientific community.
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