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All biological systems within a cell are controlled by
proteins. While some proteins act on their own, the vast
majority of proteins associate physically with each other,
forming protein–protein interactions (PPIs), to regulate
normal cellular functions and to undertake new
biological functions.

An understanding of the physical contact between
proteins in a cell is crucial for understanding cell
physiology in normal and disease conditions. Many
diseases, including cancer, are the result of the
disruption of regular PPIs as well as aberrant PPIs,
including endogenous cellular proteins and proteins
from pathogens. Therefore, the reconstruction of regular
or inhibition of aberrant interactions has significant
clinical importance. PPIs can be affected by small
molecules, some of which are already approved for
clinical applications, therefore studying the nature of the
PPIs is important for drug development.
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Life (ISSN 2075-1729) is an international, peer-reviewed
open access journal that publishes scientific studies
related to fundamental themes in life sciences. Some
papers are published individually, while others are
submitted for inclusion in special issues with guest
editors. You are invited to contribute a research article,
essay, or a review to be considered for publication.
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