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In the coming years, the onset of a revolutionary
transformation of protocols and strategies for drug
development is expected. Accurate information for
pharmacokinetics and metabolism is one of the key
factors to entering the complex arena of personalized
medicine. I would like to invite all of you, experts and
beginners in the field of drug metabolism and
pharmacokinetics, to contribute to this Special Issue
with your ideas for accelerating the implementation of
drug metabolism and pharmacokinetics research in
drug development, as well as in clinical trials and clinical
practice. This Special Issue will publish original research
articles, review articles, leading articles, and current
opinion articles on the topics discussed above. All
manuscripts are subject to peer review by international
experts.
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Life (ISSN 2075-1729) is an international, peer-reviewed
open access journal that publishes scientific studies
related to fundamental themes in life sciences. Some
papers are published individually, while others are
submitted for inclusion in special issues with guest
editors. You are invited to contribute a research article,
essay, or a review to be considered for publication.
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