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In the past 15 years, multiple articles have appeared that
target connective tissue as an important component of
treatment in the field of physical medicine and
rehabilitation. Despite a growing number of studies, the
understanding of the etiopathogenesis of connective
tissue dysfunctions remain poorly understood.
Therefore, a better understanding of the available data
and further investigation of the molecular and
biomechanical mechanisms are imperative in order to
significantly improve the understanding of the origin of
connective tissue dysfunction and the efficacy of its
treatment. 

We encourage you and your co-workers to submit your
articles reporting on this topic. Reviews and original
research articles dealing with the anatomical,
histological and physiopathological aspects associated
with connective tissue dysfunctions in both
experimental models and humans are particularly
welcome.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Life (ISSN 2075-1729) is an international, peer-reviewed
open access journal that publishes scientific studies
related to fundamental themes in life sciences. Some
papers are published individually, while others are
submitted for inclusion in special issues with guest
editors. You are invited to contribute a research article,
essay, or a review to be considered for publication.
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