
Special Issue
Updates on Respiratory
Pathologies
Message from the Guest Editor

The incidence of respiratory disorders continues to
increase worldwide. Respiratory disorders constitute a
heavy medical and socioeconomic burden, leading to
chronic health-span handicaps and shortening of
lifespan.

This Special Issue focuses on current aspects of clinical
and basic knowledge about respiratory pathologies and
their sequelae, particularly concerning cardiovascular
and brain functions.

The articles presented here will seek to contribute to the
diagnosis and therapy of a range of pulmonary
disorders, underscoring the intertwined relationship
between respiration and other neurobiological body
systems. 

The contributions presented herein will aim at
addressing the needs of professionals engaged in
respiratory and related medical fields and be a source of
inspiration for further advancements in pulmonary
clinics.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Life (ISSN 2075-1729) is an international, peer-reviewed
open access journal that publishes scientific studies
related to fundamental themes in life sciences. Some
papers are published individually, while others are
submitted for inclusion in special issues with guest
editors. You are invited to contribute a research article,
essay, or a review to be considered for publication.
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