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Climate change is increasingly impacting the wellbeing
of human populations in the Global North and South.
There is also a growing awareness of the impacts of
climate-related hazards on cultural ecosystem services
and associated effects on physical and mental
wellbeing. However, there is still a limited understanding
of how climate change impacts wellbeing across social
groups, individually and collectively, in urban areas and
how to address perceived impacts on diverse and
valued cultural services. Moreover, disentangling the
wellbeing effects of different drivers of change,
including climate-related changes and unsustainable
interventions in landscapes, as well indirect drivers of
change, such as governance, values and worldviews, is
still challenging and deserves further empirical and
methodological attention. An improved understanding
and evidence base regarding these concerns is of great
importance for developing collective visions to respond
to future climate change and to develop adequate and
inclusive approaches for adaptation that acknowledge
the specific wellbeing needs of diverse populations and
social groups beyond materialistic aspects.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Land is the only open access journal covering all
aspects of land science, and it is a pioneering platform
for publishing on land system science. Our editorial
board is comprised of eminent scholars. We publish
high quality research on societally relevant, emerging
and innovative topics and results in land system
research. It is now one of the top land journals with a
significant impact factor, and has a goal to become the
best journal in land in the coming years. I strongly
recommend Land for your best research publications for
a fast dissemination of your research.
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