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Sociofinance (also known as social finance) is an
emerging subfield of economics that studies the
implications of social factors for financial behavior. Our
preferences, limitations, and aspirations are profoundly
shaped by the surrounding norms, customs, and social
pressures. Social factors are particularly important for
finance. What is the objective of the firm? How do labor
relations affect industries and markets? What
determines corporate governance arrangements? Why
do asset price bubbles form? When is lending
predatory? What constrains fraudulent behavior? The
answers to these fundamental questions are deeply
rooted in the social environments.

This Special Issue welcomes conceptual papers, as well
as full-length articles on various topics that pertain to
social finance. Both empirical and theoretical papers
would be considered.
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Researchers are most welcome to contribute original
research articles or comprehensive review papers for
consideration and publication in Journal of Risk and
Financial Management (JRFM), an on-line, open access
journal. JRFM adheres to rigorous peer-review as well
as editorial processes, and publishes high quality
manuscripts that address theoretical, practical and
empirical issues in analysing real life financial data. The
goal of JRFM is to enable rapid dissemination of high
impact research to the scientific community.
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