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Message from the Guest Editor
Modern implantology has overcome the times when
early and delayed implant placement and loading,
extending the overall treatment time, were the usual
therapeutic approaches. It has also overcome the times
when implant positioning was not essential, soft tissue
managing was not critical, and when conventional
impressions and metal–ceramic restorations
represented the standard workflow in implant dentistry.
The development of new products and the application of
new technologies based on new scientific evidence
have led to new standards of success, a reduction in
complications, the facilitation of clinical procedures, and
improvements in the well-being of our patients. New
treatment proposals through 3D planning and
navigation surgery and new implant designs and their
prosthetic solutions offer clinicians a dental implant
solution that entails a reduction in chair-time, the
simplification of clinical procedures even in critical
situations, better respect for the surrounding tissues. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editorial Board
There has been an explosion of gene and target based
research and therapeutics in the multitude of fields that
compose clinical medicine. The Journal of Clinical
Medicine’s (JCM) staff and editorial board are dedicated
to providing cutting edge, timely, and peer-reviewed
articles covering the diverse subspecialties of clinical
medicine. The journal publishes concise, innovative, and
exciting research articles as well as clinically significant
articles and reviews that are pertinent to the myriad of
disciplines within medicine. The articles published are
relevant to both primary care physicians and specialists.
The journal’s full-texts are archived in PubMed Central
and indexed in PubMed. Please consider submitting
your manuscripts for publication to our journal and
check us out on-line!
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Rapid Publication:
manuscripts are peer-reviewed and a first decision is
provided to authors approximately 17.7 days after
submission; acceptance to publication is undertaken in 2.7
days (median values for papers published in this journal in
the first half of 2025).
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