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Message from the Guest Editor

Dear Colleagues,

Tools for the diagnosis of neurological disease used in
current clinical practice, such as cognitive psychometric
tests, clinical scores and morphological/structural
examinations of the brain, do not always unequivocally
discriminate early-stage pathological scenarios from
normal aging and do not have the same accuracy as the
analysis of hierarchically more complex aspects such as
acquired brain connectivity by neuroimaging techniques.

The identification of sensitive instrumental markers for
neurological disease is a goal of the greatest importance.

This Special Issue is a timely collection of papers that
review and propose new techniques to detect and predict
neurological disease (mild cognitive impairment (MCI),
Alzheimer disease (AD), disorders of consciousness (DOCs))
and to evaluate the efficacy of therapies. We aim to discuss
the key options for neurological diseases and state-of-the-
art treatment. Moreover, there is still the urgent need to
find measures to prevent neurons from injury or
degeneration, and ideally to keep neuronal and glial
damage under the threshold of symptom manifestation.

Please click here for more information.
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Message from the Editorial Board

There has been an explosion of gene and target based
research and therapeutics in the multitude of fields that
compose clinical medicine. The Journal of Clinical
Medicine’s (JCM) staff and editorial board are dedicated to
providing cutting edge, timely, and peer-reviewed articles
covering the diverse subspecialties of clinical medicine.
The journal publishes concise, innovative, and exciting
research articles as well as clinically significant articles and
reviews that are pertinent to the myriad of disciplines
within medicine. The articles published are relevant to both
primary care physicians and specialists. The journal’s full-
texts are archived in PubMed Central and indexed in
PubMed. Please consider submitting your manuscripts for
publication to our journal and check us out on-line!
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