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The significant trend of digital phase-shifts has been
synergized by different artefacts—machine learning  (ML)
and the Internet of Things (IoT) and their associated
security measures with the help of Blockchain and
distributed ledger technologies. However, these
technologies are developing independently, even
though they are converging closer and closer to each
other. We envisage a steady orchestration and
combination of these technologies, formulating real,
balanced industrial use-cases and challenges to be
resolved—for example, training a binary hash with a
machine learning algorithm to fit the result toward
distributed ledger and blockchain toward IoT
technologies. We also anticipate overlaps with existing
consensus algorithms for use in the industrial IoT. It is
therefore pivotal to organize and accumulate all such
research ideas under a single issue.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
The concept of Information is to disseminate scientific
results achieved via experiments and theoretical results
in depth. It is very important to enable researchers and
practitioners to learn new technology and findings that
enable development in the applied field.

Information is an online open access journal of
information science and technology, data, knowledge
and communication. It publishes reviews, regular
research papers and short communications. We invite
high quality work, and our review and publication
processing is very efficient.
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