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Natural killer (NK) cells, where discovered over 40 years
ago, and are known for their spontaneous killing of
foreign cells. We have made tremendous advances in
the basic biology of NK cells, and, in doing so, have
uncovered functional heterogeneity, plasticity and
adaptivity within the lineage and are still confronted with
questions concerning the precise roles of NK cells in
pathogen and tumor immunity. This Special Issue on
"Natural Killer (NK) Cells" will bring expert insight into
these probing topics and present novel data on NK cell
function in disease. We ask the experts in the field to
contribute their latest research, perspective, or reviews
on this fascinating and rapidly progressing topic.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
The International Journal of Molecular Sciences (IJMS,
ISSN 1422-0067) is an open access journal, which was
established in 2000. The journal aims to provide a forum
for scholarly research on a range of topics, including
biochemistry, molecular and cell biology, molecular
biophysics, molecular medicine, and all aspects of
molecular research in chemistry. IJMS publishes both
original research and review articles, and regularly
publishes special issues to highlight advances at the
cutting edge of research. We invite you to read recent
articles published in IJMS and consider publishing your
next paper with us.
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