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We are excited to announce a Special Issue dedicated
to exploring the intricate landscape of tumor evolution in
cancer. As our understanding of cancer continues to
evolve, unraveling the complexities of tumor
progression and response to treatment remains
paramount. We invite researchers from diverse
backgrounds to contribute their cutting-edge research
papers shedding light on topics such as genetic
mutations, clonal evolution, tumor heterogeneity,
metastasis, and therapeutic resistance. Through
collaborative efforts, we aim to deepen our
understanding of tumor dynamics and pave the way for
innovative strategies in cancer management. Join us in
this endeavor to advance this field and make a
meaningful impact on patient care.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
The International Journal of Molecular Sciences (IJMS,
ISSN 1422-0067) is an open access journal, which was
established in 2000. The journal aims to provide a forum
for scholarly research on a range of topics, including
biochemistry, molecular and cell biology, molecular
biophysics, molecular medicine, and all aspects of
molecular research in chemistry. IJMS publishes both
original research and review articles, and regularly
publishes special issues to highlight advances at the
cutting edge of research. We invite you to read recent
articles published in IJMS and consider publishing your
next paper with us.
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