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Developing ways to safeguard crop and food systems
relies greatly on illuminating the cellular processes and
molecular mechanisms underlying stress perception,
stress response and acquisition of resilience in crop
species. The response to adverse environmental
conditions involves the intricate relations of gene
networks and gene expression programs induced by
various abiotic stressors. Furthermore, epigenetic
factors, such as DNA methylation, histone modifications,
action of small RNAs, play crucial roles in regulating the
molecular mechanisms associated with abiotic stress
response and establishment of tolerance. Moreover, the
microbiome (soil, rhizosphere, phyllosphere,
carposphere) has an ever-increasing impact on plant
development and environmental stress resilience. This
Special Issue will focus on recent advances in the
genetic, epigenetic and microbiota aspects of crop
response to abiotic stress as well as their interactions.
We welcome contributions in this multidisciplinary field. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
The International Journal of Molecular Sciences (IJMS,
ISSN 1422-0067) is an open access journal, which was
established in 2000. The journal aims to provide a forum
for scholarly research on a range of topics, including
biochemistry, molecular and cell biology, molecular
biophysics, molecular medicine, and all aspects of
molecular research in chemistry. IJMS publishes both
original research and review articles, and regularly
publishes special issues to highlight advances at the
cutting edge of research. We invite you to read recent
articles published in IJMS and consider publishing your
next paper with us.
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