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Autism spectrum disorder (ASD) is a group of
neurodevelopmental disorders characterized by social
and communication abnormalities. Synaptic
abnormalities have been observed in preclinical ASD
models. They are thought to play a major role in ASD and
might be modified by targeted interventions. An
imbalance in excitatory to inhibitory neurotransmission
(E/I imbalance), through altered glutamatergic and
GABAergic neurotransmission, respectively, is thought
to be implicated in the pathogenesis of ASD. Molecular
abnormalities in synaptic structures and functions in
ASD involve neuroligins and neurexins, proteins that are
crucial for aligning and activating synapses along with
the SHANK3 scaffolding protein. The aim of this topic is
to contribute to disentangling the complex synaptic and
molecular abnormalities of ASD and related new
experimental treatments.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
The International Journal of Molecular Sciences (IJMS,
ISSN 1422-0067) is an open access journal, which was
established in 2000. The journal aims to provide a forum
for scholarly research on a range of topics, including
biochemistry, molecular and cell biology, molecular
biophysics, molecular medicine, and all aspects of
molecular research in chemistry. IJMS publishes both
original research and review articles, and regularly
publishes special issues to highlight advances at the
cutting edge of research. We invite you to read recent
articles published in IJMS and consider publishing your
next paper with us.
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