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Mitochondria are highly dynamic organelles that serve
as a metabolic core wherein catabolic pathways
converge upon fuel cells and building blocks for the
synthesis of essential cell components. Reactive oxygen
species and lipid peroxidation products function as
powerful signalling molecules. Cytochrome c and other
proapoptotic factors can activate cell death.
Mitochondrial DNA mediates inflammatory responses.
Further, tricarboxylic acid cycle metabolites released
from mitochondria play a broad variety of nonmetabolic
roles. In this collection, we will present an updated view
of the role of mitochondria as a core for signalling routes
involved in distinct pathological processes including
cancer, neurodegenerative syndromes, and diseases.
How accumulated knowledge on these processes is
aiding the creation of novel therapeutic approaches will
be also discussed. 
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About the Journal
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The International Journal of Molecular Sciences (IJMS,
ISSN 1422-0067) is an open access journal, which was
established in 2000. The journal aims to provide a forum
for scholarly research on a range of topics, including
biochemistry, molecular and cell biology, molecular
biophysics, molecular medicine, and all aspects of
molecular research in chemistry. IJMS publishes both
original research and review articles, and regularly
publishes special issues to highlight advances at the
cutting edge of research. We invite you to read recent
articles published in IJMS and consider publishing your
next paper with us.
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