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Endometrial cancer (EC), which arises in the lining of the
uterus, is the most common gynecologic malignancy.
Approximately 90% of cases of EC are sporadic,
whereas the remaining 10% of cases are hereditary. In
the past twenty years, there has been a shift in the EC
paradigm to consider it as a multiplicity of disease types
rather than a single disease. Improved understanding of
the molecular basis for EC could reveal potential
biomarkers of disease diagnosis and progression, as
well as lead to the identification of molecular targets for
novel therapeutic strategies of treatment. Numerous
agents targeting different components have been
developed and studied as single agents or in
combination with traditional cytotoxic agents;
additionally, molecular targeted therapies can be
combined to deliver increased benefits to patients.
Continued investigation into the molecular pathways of
EC development and progression are needed to
increase our knowledge of this disease process and will
lead to the discovery of novel, superior treatment
options for patients.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
The International Journal of Molecular Sciences (IJMS,
ISSN 1422-0067) is an open access journal, which was
established in 2000. The journal aims to provide a forum
for scholarly research on a range of topics, including
biochemistry, molecular and cell biology, molecular
biophysics, molecular medicine, and all aspects of
molecular research in chemistry. IJMS publishes both
original research and review articles, and regularly
publishes special issues to highlight advances at the
cutting edge of research. We invite you to read recent
articles published in IJMS and consider publishing your
next paper with us.
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