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Oncological rehabilitation is based on reaching an
adequate quality of life for cancer patients, helping the
patient and his/her family to adapt to living standards, as
close as possible to those preceding the disease. The
rehabilitation process in cancer patients requires a
multidisciplinary and interdisciplinary approach that is
based on an individual project according to the specific
needs and outcomes that take into account the different
phases of taking charge of the cancer patient.
Therefore, a complex and long rehabilitation path, which
even before the COVID-19 emergency, recognized
some barriers in its practical application and which, to
date, has become even more complex in its
implementation.

Then, virtuous and novel rehabilitation paths are
desirable in cancer patients starting from global care,
taking into account the bio-psycho-social model and
proposing solutions to favor a rehabilitation alliance,
even in home-settings or in telerehabilitation, together
with, or instead of, traditional settings (outpatient or
inpatient), in order to guarantee the patient a reduction
in disability and an adequate quality of life.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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