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Cardiovascular disease is the number one cause of
death in the world. Advances in diagnosis, research, and
treatment represent the winning strategy in order to
defeat this enemy. In particular, new advances in
cardiovascular disease mainly affect the following areas:
new drugs to cut the cholesterol level by half, new
strategies for controlling blood pressure, exploring
biomarkers and genes to expand the knowledge of
cardiovascular disease, replacing the aortic valve
without surgery, exploring options to treat congenital
heart disease, endovascular treatment of aortic disease,
minimally invasive surgery, engineering T cells to fight
heart damage, and a new understanding of heart failure.
In this Special Issue, we would like to provide an
overview of the most recent discoveries related to this
topic. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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