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The main objective of this Special Issue is to explore
how self-regulation can become a fundamental element
that underlies much of the behavior, both adapted and
maladaptive, which develops during childhood and
adolescence. In general, this issue aims to collect
original contributions that work on issues related to the
influence of self-regulation on the personal, social, and
academic development of children and adolescents. In
this way, work can be presented that takes into account
the self-regulation of behavior and its influence on
aspects such as learning difficulties, behavioral
problems, and involvement in risky behavior or mental
health problems. Likewise, special consideration will be
given to studies that present innovative interventions to
develop self-regulation from early stages of
development; work carried out on topics of clear social
interest; or that implement longitudinal studies.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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