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Health assessment is the evaluation of physical or
mental health status, and is used for early detection of
diseases in people that may look and feel well.
Comprehensive and efficient health-assessment tools
or approaches can help to accurately understand health
status for prevention or timely treatment/intervention of
diseases.
Health interventions are programs or services delivered
or undertaken primarily to treat disease or to maintain or
restore functional ability. This is determined not only by
the intervention itself, but also by the medical condition
and patients’ health expectations. The methods or
approaches of health assessment and interventions
may vary for different populations, types of diseases,
cultures, races, etc. 
Papers of a high academic standard that address the
current state of knowledge and evidence on health
assessment and intervention methods of human health
are welcome for this Special Issue.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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