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The rapid and unexpected presence of the COVID-19
pandemic created many challenges in the care for older
adults living at home. The situation revealed problems
but also resulted in several possible solutions for older
adults and care workers to deal with problems and
challenges. The pandemic will likely cause lasting
changes in care delivery at home and result in lessons
learned that need to be distributed. A Special Issue of
the International Journal of Environmental Research and
Public Health on "Geriatric Care at Home During the
Covid-19 Pandemic" will be launched. This Special Issue
will include high-quality quantitative and qualitative
research (original articles, critical reviews, research
notes, and short communications) on various aspects of
COVID-19 and its challenges in geriatric care at home. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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