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Neurodevelopment is the result of a multifactorial
process and can be defined as the dynamic
interrelationship that occurs between genetic, cerebral,
cognitive, emotional, and behavioral processes. A whole
range of factors have been identified as protectors for
an adequate neurodevelopment in children. When these
factors do not appear or appear partially, they can
become a source of toxic stress for the child, affecting
health, learning process, quality of emotional and social
relationships. The main risk factors for
neurodevelopment relate to prenatal stage conditions;
perinatal circumstances; nutritional, infectious, toxic
factors; parenting practices, socioeconomic conditions.
The effects of toxic stress on early childhood may
persist in later stages and have effects on adult health.
Early detection of these situations are key elements to
protect and optimize their progress and avoid the
chronification of problems in the different areas of
health.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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