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Our Special Issue attempts to highlight the mechanisms
upon which the economic crises affect health, health
outcomes, and healthcare-seeking behavior. It
documents the need for expeditious and efficient
interventions. In addition, it presents the empirical
experience from policies that have been implemented
to counterbalance the effects of a rapidly slowing
economy and critically evaluates their results on health
and healthcare.

Evidence-based suggestions on the causes, the effects,
and the response to the problem are within the scope of
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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