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vulnerable to stress. This Special Issue will include
articles on disorders related to the work environment
and possible related variables, specifically on burnout
syndrome. Occupational health is a major problem in
modern work environments. According to the World
Health Organization (WHO), workplace health risks
cause occupational diseases and can aggravate other
health problems. As a result, the incidence of
occupational disorders and problems has increased in
workers in recent years. Analyzing different variables
related to more common occupational diseases is
important to deal with them efficiently.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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