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This Special Issue of IJERPH aims to advance the field
of air pollution within the area of disease burden. This
Issue will focus on the novel topic of air pollution in the
context of disease’s etiology or disease burden. It aims
to focus on the effects of air pollution on respiratory,
cardiovascular, and brain symptoms/diseases. This
Issue welcomes both quantitative and qualitative
studies and is intended to include papers that assess
the effects of air pollution on the development of
diseases, as well as the health impacts. Identification of
the sources apportionment and sensitive exposure
windows increases the accuracy and precision of risk
assessment, and provides the possibility of focusing on
preventive efforts in a cost-effective manner.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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