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Despite many decades of committed efforts to reduce
the burden of cardiovascular disease, it continues to be
the leading cause of death worldwide. Evidence-based
guidelines and policies exist to help prevent and
manage cardiovascular disease. However, rates of
cardiovascular risk assessment are low in primary
healthcare, admission and readmission rates are still
high, many of those with cardiovascular disease are not
provided with the optimal care, and patients find it
challenging to adhere to the appropriate management
after surviving the disease. In this Special Issue, we
welcome your work that explores or attempts to find
solutions to these ongoing issues that impede the
prevention and management of cardiovascular disease.
This includes methods to provide and/or promote
primary or secondary prevention and management of
cardiovascular disease at the policy-level, patient-level,
and different levels of the healthcare system. Innovative,
scalable approaches to provide support for the
clinicians and patients are also invited.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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