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The aim of this Special Issue is to publish contributions
on the social and emotional aspects of work in the new
normal. We welcome the submission of studies
examining how different types of workplaces or
organizational environments, such as schools, where
teachers, students and parents interact; hospitals,
where nurses, doctors and patients interact; and
government settings, among many others, affect the
social and/or emotional aspects of individuals, along
with the various precursors that contribute to such
changes. In addition, we are also interested in research
that analyzes the impact of the new normal on human
behavior and emotions, and what can be done to
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individuals in the workplace; how social and/or
emotional aspects of individuals are affected by
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students; social and/or emotional effectiveness.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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