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It is well known that health and wellbeing interventions
are feasible, safe and effective for the majority of
population groups to improve their overall health.
However, while short-term changes in behaviours,
ranging from increased physical activity and improved
diet and nutrition to increased water intake and sleep
quality, have been consistently shown, long-term
changes prove harder to sustain. Other challenges
include low engagement and retention and resource-
intensive and researcher/expert-led interventions that
are expensive and difficult to sustain for many
organisations.

Peer-led interventions are an emerging trend and have
shown promise in being able to address some of the
issues described above. Participants or patient groups
often respond more favourably to people they can relate
to. Peer-led interventions may also be more cost-
effective and sustainable in the long term. This Special
Issue seeks to bring together a group of research
papers that address the feasibility, effectiveness and
future potential of peer-led interventions, ranging from
single-activity (e.g., exercise) to multi-activity holistic
wellbeing interventions.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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