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Mental health is defined by the World Health
Organisation as “a state of well-being in which every
individual realises their potential, can cope with the
normal stresses of life, can work productively and
fruitfully, and is able to make a contribution to
community”. The achievement of mental health and the
prevention and treatment of, and early intervention into,
mental health problems and disorders have been
identified as public health priorities globally. A broad
range of ecological influences impact mental health.
Mental health is important throughout the lifespan with
interventions implemented in many settings. This
Special Issue of the International Journal of
Environmental Research and Public Health (IJERPH)
focuses on mental health care and promotion. We
encourage the submission of original research papers,
reviews, and case studies that contribute new
knowledge in this area. Intervention studies, trials, and
epidemiological studies are encouraged. The focus may
include a specific population group, setting, or system.
We encourage manuscripts that articulate research
across the spectrum, including prevention, early
intervention, care, and promotion.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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