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Addictive prescription medications commonly induce
psychiatric mental states, suicides, violence, homicides,
and medical complications such as lung and heart
diseases. Increased legal access to addicting
prescription medications has increased diversion and
illicit use, not decreased as expected. Expanded legal
access to opioid medications and medical marijuana
has increased, not decreased, public health problems.
For this Special Issue, we invite submissions that
examine the prevalence, morbidity, mortality, physician
and pharmaceutical practices, public health laws and
initiatives, and other aspects of addictive prescription
drug abuse and addiction.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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