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Regular physical activity offers many health benefits in
children and adolescents, helping to manage some
conditions such as obesity, diabetes, and hyperactivity.
A higher level of physical fitness has also been
associated with higher academic performance in
children.
Several studies found a relationship between physical
activity and health-related quality of life (HRQOL), so it is
important to increase the level of physical activity in
order to improve HRQOL in youths. HRQOL can be
measured by either objective or subjective ways.
Therefore, the purpose of this Special Issue is to
document progress in the knowledge of how physical
activity practice can improve HRQOL in children and
adolescents.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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