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In the ever-changing times we are living in, with concern
over potential health impacts, greater focus is being
placed on the role of environmental and public health
research to facilitate evidence-based policy decision-
making. Economic evaluation has traditionally been
applied to decision-making with respect to problems
relating to the management of individuals, particularly
the optimal choice of clinical management strategies.
Increasingly, the need to demonstrate cost
effectiveness and return on investment with respect to
initiatives focusing on the environment and the health of
the population as a whole are being recognized. In this
Special Issue, we invite researchers who are active in
the conducting of economic evaluations in both
environmental research and public health research to
submit high-quality empirical and methodological
articles. Articles can be in any area of environmental and
public health research, but the focus must be on either
the methods for, or the conducting of, studies to assess
the cost effectiveness of policy, practices, or
interventions.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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