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The rapid effects in the context of the COVID-19
pandemic on the musculoskeletal system are due to
physical and mental inactivity caused by environmental
factors (isolation from both nature and social
distancing).
The COVID-19 pandemic is a major challenge for all
organizations. Biological agents may affect occupational
safety, while personal protective equipment used during
the pandemic may affect the environment. Distance
working or online education may impact upon the
mental health of the population. That is why it is
important to study the effects of the pandemic on
occupational and environmental safety.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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