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Evidence-based practice (EBP) is an important tool in
improving healthcare quality and patient outcomes,
while also reducing the overall cost of care. It involves
forming a clinical question to identify a problem,
gathering the best evidence, analyzing the evidence,
applying the evidence to clinical practice, and assessing
the result. It can provide health workers with the
scientific research to make well-founded decisions, and
help them pinpoint care strategies that can help their
patients. It helps ultimately to improve the public health,
which is high in our concerns. This Special Issue aims to
provide a venue for networking and communication with
scholars and health workers, in order to help bridge the
gap between research-generated evidence and clinical
nursing practice and education. We welcome original
articles, review papers, communications, brief reports,
case reports, etc. All papers will be published with fully
open access after peer review.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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