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Dental public health and pediatric dentistry are two
recognized specialties. Looking at the definition of each
of them, one can easily see that they are closely
intertwined. Dental public health is concerned with the
diagnosis, prevention, and control of dental diseases, as
well as the promotion of oral health through organized
community efforts. Pediatric dentistry is concerned with
providing primary and comprehensive preventive and
therapeutic oral health diagnosis, care, and consultative
expertise for infants and children through adolescence,
including those of all ages and with special care needs.
This Special Issue of the International Journal of
Environmental Research and Public Health aims to
publish articles focusing on dental public health issues
in pediatric dentistry. 
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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