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Health systems in which Primary Care plays a
coordinating role tend to achieve better population
health outcomes. Nursing has contributed significantly
to both the management of health systems and
services, as well as to direct patient care. However,
considerable challenges remain in ensuring equitable
access to services that are essential for comprehensive
and continuous care. Furthermore, advancements in
nursing practice are necessary to enhance supported
self-care, as well as to foster user and community
participation and engagement aimed at improving well-
being and quality of life.
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About the Journal
Message from the Editor-in-Chief
Addressing the environmental and public health
challenges requires engagement and collaboration
among clinicians and public health researchers.
Scientific discoveries and advances in this research
field play a critical role in providing a rational basis for
informed decision-making toward control and
prevention of human diseases, especially the illnesses
that are induced from environmental exposure to health
hazards.
IJERPH provides a forum for discussion of discoveries
and knowledge in these multidisciplinary fields. Please
consider publishing your research in this high quality
peer-reviewed journal.
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